
WASHOE COUNTY 
Integrity Communication Service 

www.washoecounty.us 

AGENDA ITEM # ______ 

 

  
   
 STAFF REPORT  
 BOARD MEETING DATE:  October 23, 2018  
    
   

DATE: September 21, 2018 

TO: Board of County Commissioners 

FROM: Bob Webb, Planning Manager, Planning and Building Division 
Community Services Department, 328-3623, bwebb@washoecounty.us 

THROUGH: Mojra Hauenstein, Arch., Planner, Division Director, Planning & 
Building Division, Community Services Dept., 328-
3619, mhauenstein@washoecounty.us 

SUBJECT: Public Hearing: Second reading and adoption of an ordinance amending 
the Washoe County Code at Chapter 110 (Development Code) to change 
the number of van accessible handicapped parking spaces required in 
accordance with Washoe County Code Table 110.410.15.1 from one per 
eight handicapped parking spaces to one per six handicapped parking 
spaces for any parking facility serving the public; and, to address other 
matters necessarily connected therewith and pertaining thereto. (All 
Commission Districts.) 

 

SUMMARY 
To conduct the second reading of, and possibly adopt, an ordinance amending Washoe 
County Code Chapter 110 to change the number of required van accessible handicapped 
parking spaces from one per eight handicapped parking spaces to one per six 
handicapped parking spaces.   

Washoe County Strategic Objective supported by this item:  Proactive Economic 
Development and Diversification 

PREVIOUS ACTION 
On August 31, 2018, the Director of the Planning and Development Division, 
Community Services Department, initiated WDCA18-0004, a technical revision to the 
Development Code to change the number of van accessible handicapped parking spaces 
required in accordance with Washoe County Code Table 110.410.15.1 from one per eight 
handicapped parking spaces to one per six handicapped parking spaces. 
 
On October 9, 2018, the Board initiated an amendment to the Development Code for 
WDCA18-0004, the technical revision to the Development Code to change the number of 
van accessible handicapped parking spaces required in accordance with Washoe County 
Code Table 110.410.15.1 from eight to six. 
 
  

http://www.washoecounty.us/
file://wcadmin/communityservices$/Marijuana/Marijuana%20Establishment%20(new)%20regulations/business%20license%20fees/BCC%20hearing,%20March%2027%202018,%20adopt%20BIS/bwebb@washoecounty.us
mailto:mhauenstein@washoecounty.us


Washoe County Commission Meeting of October 23, 2018 
Page 2 of 4 

  
 

BACKGROUND 

PROPOSED TECHNICAL REVISION 
 
Handicapped parking spaces are regulated within Washoe County Code (WCC) Chapter 
100 (Buildings and Construction) and the WCC Chapter 110 (Development Code).  Both 
WCC Chapters establish the handicapped parking spaces required for new development 
(Development Code) and new buildings or uses within a building (Building and 
Construction).  Specific to this technical revision, WCC Section 110.410.15(c)(1) 
requires that one of every eight required handicapped parking spaces be a van accessible 
space (code extract appears below, highlights and underline added). 
 

Section 110.410.15  Special Parking Provisions. 
 

(c) Handicapped Parking.  In any parking facility serving the public, parking for the 
handicapped shall be provided as set forth in this subsection. 

 
(1) Handicapped parking spaces shall be provided in accordance with Table 

110.410.15.1.  One (1) of every eight (8) required handicapped spaces shall be a 
van accessible space (a minimum of one (1) van accessible space per parking 
area). 

 
This section of the Development Code was last amended on July 7, 1993.  Planning staff 
was informed by a concerned citizen that the 2010 U.S. Department of Justice (DOJ) 
Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) Standards (Titles II and III) require that for every 
six handicapped parking spaces, at least one shall be a van parking space (see Attachment 
B, highlights added). 
 
The DOJ ADA Standards provide guidance to local jurisdictions, but do not carry the 
force of law when enforcing local jurisdiction development and building regulations.  
However, Section 1106.5, Van Spaces, of the 2012 International Building Code (IBC) 
requires that for every six handicapped accessible parking spaces, at least one shall be a 
van-accessible parking space (see Attachment C, highlights added).   
 
The 2012 IBC was adopted by reference into WCC Chapter 100, so the IBC carries the 
force of law for building regulations within unincorporated Washoe County.  Therefore 
the Development Code must be amended to conform to WCC Chapter 100.  The specific 
technical revision to the Development Code appears below (highlights added): 
 

Section 110.410.15  Special Parking Provisions. 
 

(c) Handicapped Parking.  In any parking facility serving the public, parking for the 
handicapped shall be provided as set forth in this subsection. 

 
(1) Handicapped parking spaces shall be provided in accordance with Table 

110.410.15.1.  One (1) of every six eight (8) required handicapped spaces shall 
be a van accessible space (a minimum of one (1) van accessible space per 
parking area). 

 
The technical revisions will also make minor grammar edits within WCC Section 
110.410.15 to eliminate duplicate numbering.  Specifically, a reference to “one (1)” will 



Washoe County Commission Meeting of October 23, 2018 
Page 3 of 4 

  
 

be amended to read as “one”.  Letters will be used for numbers from one to nine, and 
numbers for any number greater than 10. 
 
TECHNICAL REVISION CODE AMENDMENT PROCESS 
 
WCC Section 110.818.60 enables technical revisions to the Development Code by the 
Director of the Planning and Building Division (see Attachment D).  Technical revisions 
are initiated by the Director [WCC Section 110.818.60(c)(1)] and proceed directly to the 
Washoe County Board of County Commissioners (BCC) for a first and second reading.  
The Director initiated this technical revision (WDCA18-0004) on August 31, 2018 (see 
Attachment E).  WCC Section 110.818.60(d) requires certain findings to be made by the 
Director in order to initiate a technical revision.  This technical revision qualifies based 
on the following requirements: 
 

1. Mandated by federal law, whether by statute or court decision, and when no 
significant discretion can be exercised by the County [WCC Section 
110.818.60(b)(2); DOJ ADA standards];  and, 

2. Needed to conform to an action taken by another County agency [WCC Section 
110.818.60(b)(6); 2012 IBC adopted by reference into WCC Chapter 100]. 

 
The technical revision is consistent with all of the statutes, plans and codes outlined in 
WCC Section 110.818.60(d)(2).  WCC Section 110.818.60(e) requires that the Planning 
Commission (Chair and members) and Citizen Advisory Boards (Chairs and members) 
be notified of the proposed technical revision and be provided the opportunity to provide 
objections or comments.  The Planning Commission (PC) and the Citizen Advisory 
Boards (CAB) were notified by e-mail on August 29, 2018 and by postal mail on August 
30, 2018 of the proposed technical amendment (see Attachment F).  The PC and CAB 
Chairs and members were asked to provide any objections or comments by September 6, 
2018 in order for staff to include their responses within this staff report. 
 
Staff received responses from two PC members (Chesney and Donshick) and six CAB 
members (Brockman, Christensen, Edwards, Giddings, Rummings, and Theiss).  All of 
the PC and CAB responding Chairs/members have no objections to or comments on the 
proposed technical revision.  Staff can provide copies of their responses if the Board 
requests.   
 
FISCAL IMPACT 
No fiscal impact. 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
It is recommended that the Board conduct a second reading and adopt an ordinance 
amending the Washoe County Code at Chapter 110 (Development Code) to change the 
number of van accessible handicapped parking spaces required in accordance with 
Washoe County Code Table 110.410.15.1 from one per eight handicapped parking spaces 
to one per six handicapped parking spaces for any parking facility serving the public; 
and, to address other matters necessarily connected therewith and pertaining thereto.   
 



Washoe County Commission Meeting of October 23, 2018 
Page 4 of 4 

  
 

POSSIBLE MOTION 
Should the Board agree with the recommendation, a possible motion would be:   

“Move to adopt Ordinance Number [insert ordinance number as provided by the County 
Clerk] amending the Washoe County Code at Chapter 110 (Development Code) to 
change the number of van accessible handicapped parking spaces required in accordance 
with Washoe County Code Table 110.410.15.1 from one per eight handicapped parking 
spaces to one per six handicapped parking spaces for any parking facility serving the 
public; and, to address other matters necessarily connected therewith and pertaining 
thereto.”  

 
Attachments: A. Proposed Ordinance 
 B. 2010 DOJ ADA Standards (Titles II and III) (extract) 
 C. 2012 IBC, Section 1106 
 D. WCC Section 110.818.60 
 E. Technical Revision Initiation 
 F. Notification of PC and CABs 
 
 



DRAFT:  September 7, 2018 

Page 1 of 8 

WORKING COPY 

INFORMATION ONLY 

REGULAR TEXT:  NO CHANGE IN LANGUAGE 

STRIKEOUT TEXT:  DELETE LANGUAGE 

BOLD TEXT:  NEW LANGUAGE 

*********************************************************** 

Notice:  Per NRS 239B.030, this document does not contain 

personal information as defined in NRS 603A.040 

Summary: Amends the Washoe County Code at Chapter 110 

(Development Code) to change the required number of 

van accessible handicapped parking spaces from one per 

eight handicapped parking spaces to one per six 

handicapped parking spaces. 

BILL NO.  ____ 

ORDINANCE NO.  ____ 

Title: 

An Ordinance amending the Washoe County Code at Chapter 110 

(Development Code) to change the number of van accessible 

handicapped parking spaces required in accordance with Washoe 

County Code Table 110.410.15.1 from one per eight handicapped 

parking spaces to one per six handicapped parking spaces for any 

parking facility serving the public; and, to address other 

matters necessarily connected therewith and pertaining thereto. 

WHEREAS: 

A. The number of required van accessible handicapped parking

spaces as prescribed in Washoe County Code Chapter 110 does

not match the number of spaces as regulated in the 2012

International Building Code as adopted by Washoe County

within Washoe County Code Chapter 100; and,

B. Washoe County Code Section 110.818.60 provides a method to

amend the Code by technical revision in order to conform

with actions taken by another County agency, in this case

the adoption of standards for the number of required van

accessible handicapped parking spaces; and,

Attachment A



DRAFT:  September 7, 2018 

Page 2 of 8 

C. The Director of the Planning and Building Division of the

Washoe County Community Services Department initiated the

proposed amendments on August 31, 2018 following the

provisions of Washoe County Code Section 110.818.60(c)(1);

and,

D. The amendments and this Ordinance were drafted in concert

with the District Attorney; and,

E. Following a first reading and publication as required by

NRS 244.100(1), and after a duly noticed public hearing,

this Board desires to adopt this Ordinance; and,

F. This Commission has determined that this ordinance is being

adopted pursuant to requirements set forth in Chapter 278

of NRS, therefore it is not a “rule” as defined in NRS

237.060 requiring a business impact statement.

THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF WASHOE COUNTY DOES HEREBY 

ORDAIN: 

SECTION 1.  Section 110.410.15 is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

Section 110.410.15  Special Parking Provisions. 

(a) Motorcycle and Bicycle Spaces.  For every four (4) motorcycle or six (6) bicycle parking

spaces provided, a credit of one (1) parking space shall be given toward the

requirements of this article, provided, however, that the credit for each shall not exceed

one-fortieth (1/40) of the total number of automobile spaces required.  If determined

necessary by the County Engineer, bollards shall be installed to separate and protect

motorcycle and bicycle spaces from automobile circulation.  The minimum dimensions for

motorcycle and bicycle spaces shall be as set forth in the following subsections:

(1) Motorcycle spaces shall be a minimum of seven (7) feet in length and three (3)

feet four (4) inches in width as illustrated in Figure 110.410.15.1.

(2) Bicycle spaces shall be a minimum of six (6) feet in length and two (2) feet six (6)

inches in width as illustrated in Figure 110.410.15.2.

(b) Bicycle Storage.  In commercial and industrial projects with twenty (20) or more required

parking spaces, a rack or other secure device for the purpose of storing and protecting

bicycles from theft shall be installed.  Such devices shall be provided with a minimum

capacity of one bicycle per twenty (20) required parking spaces and shall be located so

as not to interfere with pedestrian or vehicular traffic.

(c) Handicapped Parking.  In any parking facility serving the public, parking for the 

handicapped shall be provided as set forth in this subsection. 



DRAFT:  September 7, 2018 

Page 3 of 8 

(1) Handicapped parking spaces shall be provided in accordance with Table

110.410.15.1.  One (1) of every six eight (8) required handicapped spaces shall

be a van accessible space (a minimum of one (1) van accessible space per

parking area).

(2) Handicapped parking spaces shall be a minimum of eight (8) feet in width and a

minimum of eighteen (18) feet in length, as illustrated in Figure 110.410.15.3.

(3) Handicapped spaces shall be provided with an adjacent access aisle, as

illustrated in Figure 110.410.15.3.  Access aisles shall be a minimum of five (5)

feet in width.  Van access aisles shall be a minimum of eight (8) feet in width.

Access aisles shall be located on the passenger side of each space unless it is

located between and is shared by two (2) designated spaces.

(4) Handicapped parking spaces and access aisles shall be level.

(5) Handicapped spaces shall be located as near as possible to accessible building

or site entrances and shall be located so as to provide convenient access to curb

ramps.

(6) Each reserved handicapped parking space shall be designated with a stall sign

displaying the International Symbol of Accessibility, as illustrated in Figure

110.410.15.4.  Each stall sign shall be at least seventy (70) square inches in

size.  Spaces that are van accessible shall be designated as "Van Accessible."

(7) Each reserved handicapped parking space shall meet one (1) of the following

stall markings requirements:

(i) Each handicapped parking space shall be painted solid blue with a white

International Symbol of Accessibility; or

(ii) Each handicapped parking space shall be outlined in blue with a three

(3) foot square International Symbol of Accessibility painted in a

contrasting color.

(8) Each reserved handicapped parking space shall be marked with a sign warning

drivers of the possibility of towing due to unauthorized use and providing

information of recovering towed vehicles.  Warning signs shall have minimum

dimensions of seventeen (17) inches by twenty-two (22) inches and shall be

labeled with lettering of at least one (1) inch in height.

(9) A minimum of ninety-eight (98) vertical inches of clearance shall be provided for

van accessible spaces and the entire route from parking area ingress/egress

points to the parking space.

(10) As illustrated in Figure 110.410.15.5, a minimum vehicle overhang allowance of

twenty-four (24) inches shall be provided between accessible routes and

handicapped parking spaces.  Said accessible routes shall, at all times, provide

users with a minimum width of thirty-six (36) inches of throughway.



DRAFT:  September 7, 2018 

Page 4 of 8 

Figure 110.410.15.1 

MOTORCYCLE PARKING DIMENSIONS 

Source: Sedway Cooke Associates. 

 

 

Figure 110.410.15.2 

BICYCLE PARKING DIMENSIONS 

Source: Sedway Cooke Associates. 

 

 

7 ft.

Minimum

3 ft. 4 in.
Minimum

3 ft. 4 in.
Minimum  

6 ft.

Minimum

2 ft. 6 in.

Minimum

2 ft. 6 in.

Minimum  



DRAFT:  September 7, 2018 

Page 5 of 8 

Table 110.410.15.1 

HANDICAPPED ACCESSIBLE SPACES 

Spaces in Lot Required Number of Accessible Spaces 

1 to 25 1 

26 to 50 2 

51 to 75 3 

76 to 100 4 

101 to 150 5 

151 to 200 6 

201 to 300 7 

301 to 400 8 

401 to 500 9 

501 to 1,000 2 percent of Total 

1,001 and over 20 plus 1 per 100 above 1,000 

Source: Washoe County Department of Community Development. 

 

 

Figure 110.410.15.3 

HANDICAPPED PARKING DIMENSIONS 

Source: Sedway Cooke Associates. 

 

 

Car Car Van

5 ft.
Min.

18 ft.
Min.

8 ft. 8 ft. 8 ft. 8 ft.
Min.Min. Min. Min.  



DRAFT:  September 7, 2018 

Page 6 of 8 

Figure 110.410.15.4 

INTERNATIONAL SYMBOL OF ACCESSIBILITY 

Source: Sedway Cooke Associates. 

Figure 110.410.15.5 

ACCESSIBLE ROUTES 

Source: Sedway Cooke Associates. 

Proportions Display
Conditions

36 in. 24 in.
Min. Min.



DRAFT:  September 7, 2018 

Page 7 of 8 

SECTION 2.  General Terms. 

1. All actions, proceedings, matters, and things heretofore
taken, had and done by the County and its officers not
inconsistent with the provisions of this Ordinance are
ratified and approved.

2. The Chairman of the Board and officers of the County are
authorized and directed to take all action necessary or
appropriate to effectuate the provisions of this Ordinance.
The District Attorney is authorized to make non-substantive
edits and corrections to this Ordinance.

3. All ordinances, resolutions, bylaws and orders, or parts
thereof, in conflict with the provisions of this Ordinance

are hereby repealed to the extent only of such
inconsistency.  This repealer shall not be construed to
revive any ordinance, resolution, bylaw or order, or part
thereof, heretofore repealed.

4. Each term and provision of this Ordinance shall be valid
and shall be enforced to the extent permitted by law.  If
any term or provision of this Ordinance or the application
thereof shall be deemed by a court of competent
jurisdiction to be in violation of law or public policy,
then it shall be deemed modified, ipso facto, to bring it
within the limits of validity or enforceability, but if it
cannot be so modified, then the offending provision or term
shall be excised from this Ordinance.  In any event, the

remainder of this Ordinance, or the application of such
term or provision to circumstances other than those to
which it is invalid or unenforceable, shall not be
affected.



Page 8 of 8 

DRAFT:  September 7, 2018 

Passage and Effective Date 

Proposed on _________________ (month) ________ (day),2018. 

Proposed by Commissioner ______________________________. 

Passed on ____________________ (month) _______ (day),2018. 

Vote:  

Ayes: 

Nays: 

Absent: 

Marsha Berkbigler,Chair 

Washoe County Commission

ATTEST: 

___________________________________ 

Nancy Parent, County Clerk 

This ordinance shall be in force and effect from and after the 

______ day of the month of _______________ of the year ________. 



Attachment B







Attachment C





Washoe County Development Code Extract May 8, 2015 
AMENDMENT OF DEVELOPMENT CODE Page 818-1 

Section 110.818.60  Technical Revision to Development Code. 

(a) Purpose of Technical Revision.  The purpose of the technical revision section is

to provide a streamlined process for adopting changes that have no independent

substantive effect on the Development Code.

(b) Requirements for Inclusion.  To qualify as a technical revision under this section,

the change must be: 

(1) Mandated by state law, whether by statute or court decision, and when

no significant discretion can be exercised by the County;

(2) Mandated by federal law, whether by statute or court decision, and when

no significant discretion can be exercised by the County;

(3) Required to avoid a sanction under federal law, and when no significant

discretion can be exercised by the County;

(4) Required to avoid disqualification from a federal program, and when no

significant discretion can be exercised by the County;

(5) To obtain a benefit under federal law, and when no significant discretion

can be exercised by the County;

(6) Needed to conform to an action taken by another County agency even if

that action does not result in a change in the Washoe County Code;

(7) Needed to conform to a name change or other change made in the

Washoe County Code; or

(8) Needed to improve or clarify the Development Code when there is not

substantive effect on the Development Code.

(c) Administrative Process.

(1) Initiating the Process.  The Director of Community Development shall

have the sole authority to initiate a technical revision to the Development

Code.

(2) Transmittal to Board of County Commissioners.  Upon making the

findings required under subsection (d) of this section, the Director of

Community Development shall forward the technical revision to the

Board of County Commissioners.

(d) Findings.

(1) The Director of Community Development must find that the proposed

technical revision meets one of the conditions enumerated under this

section.  If the enumerated condition is one of those set forth in Section

110.818.60 (b), subsection (1) through (5), the Director of Community

Development must specifically identify the independent source of the

substantive change the technical revision will have on the Development

Code.

Attachment D



Washoe County Development Code Extract May 8, 2015 
AMENDMENT OF DEVELOPMENT CODE Page 818-2 

(2) The Director of Community Development must also find that the 

proposed technical revision is consistent with all of the following: 

(i) Nevada Revised Statutes; 

(ii) The Truckee Meadows Regional Plan; 

(iii) The Washoe County Master Plan; and 

(iv) The purposes of the Development Code. 

(3) If an independent legal authority mandates a change that is inconsistent 

with Nevada Revised Statutes, the Truckee Meadows Regional Plan, the 

Washoe County Master Plan, or the purposes of the Development Code; 

the Director of Community Development shall specifically identify that 

independent legal authority and the provision with which the technical 

revision will be inconsistent. 

(e) Action by Board of County Commissioners.  The Board of County 

Commissioners shall review proposed technical revisions to the Development 

Code in conformance with this section. 

(1) Time Period for Hearing.  The Clerk of the Board of County 

Commissioners shall schedule a public hearing before the Board of 

County Commissioners on the recommendation of approval by the 

Director of Community Development of a technical revision to the 

Development Code within thirty (30) days of the filing of the 

recommended technical revision with the Clerk of the Board of County 

Commissioners. 

(2) Notice of Introduction of Ordinance and Public Hearing.  The introduction 

of the ordinance and public hearing on the ordinance shall be noticed as 

follows: 

(i) Notice to Planning Commission.  A notice setting forth the date, 

time and place of the introduction of the ordinance concerning 

the technical revision to the Development Code shall be sent 

either by mail, or if requested by a Washoe County Planning 

Commission member, by electronic means if receipt of such an 

electronic notice can be verified, to every member of the Washoe 

County Planning Commission not less than ten (10) days prior to 

the scheduled introduction of the ordinance.  The notice shall 

describe the proposed technical revision to the Development 

Code, including the specific language and other pertinent 

information, in such a manner that the proposed technical 

revision to the Development Code and its effect(s) can be clearly 

identified.  Any objections or comments from members of the 

Planning Commission must be provided to the Director of 

Community Development or the Board of County Commissioners 

no later than at the introduction of the ordinance. 

(ii) Notice to Citizen Advisory Boards.  A notice setting forth the 

date, time and place of the introduction of the ordinance 

concerning the technical revision to the Development Code shall 



Washoe County Development Code Extract May 8, 2015 
AMENDMENT OF DEVELOPMENT CODE Page 818-3 

be sent either by mail, or if requested by a citizen advisory board 

member, by electronic means if receipt of such an electronic 

notice can be verified, to every chairperson and member of a 

citizen advisory board created by the Board of County 

Commissioners not less than ten (10) days prior to the 

scheduled introduction of the ordinance.  The notice to the 

chairperson shall describe the proposed technical revision to the 

Development Code, including the specific language and other 

pertinent information, in such a manner that the proposed 

technical revision to the Development Code and its effect(s) can 

be clearly identified.  The notice to a citizen advisory board 

member, other than the chairperson, shall describe the proposed 

technical revision to the Development Code in such a manner 

that the proposed technical revision to the Development Code 

and its effect(s) can be clearly identified.  Any objections or 

comments from members of a citizen advisory board must be 

provided to the Director of Community Development or the Board 

of County Commissioners no later than at the introduction of the 

ordinance. 

(iii) Notice in Newspaper.  A notice setting forth the date, time and 

place of the public hearing shall be published in a newspaper of 

general circulation in Washoe County not less than ten (10) days 

prior to the public hearing date.  The notice shall describe the 

proposed technical revision to the Development Code and other 

pertinent information in such a manner that the Development 

Code amendment request and its effect(s) can be clearly 

identified. 

(3) Board of County Commissioners’ Action.  The Board of County 

Commissioners may take final action to adopt or deny the technical 

revision to the Development Code.  Final action to approve the technical 

revision shall require a simple majority vote of the total membership of 

the Board. 

 



Attachment E



COMMUNITY SERVICES DEPARTMENT 
Planning and Building Division 

Planning Program 

1001 EAST 9
TH

 STREET 
PO BOX 11130 
RENO, NEVADA 89520-0027 
PHONE (775) 328-6100 
FAX (775) 328.6133 

August 29, 2018 

SUSPENSE:  SEPTEMBER 6, 2018 

To: Washoe County Planning Commissioners 

From: Bob Webb, Planning Manager 

Subject: Technical Revision to Development Code, Van Accessible Handicapped Parking 
Spaces 

Washoe County Code (WCC) Section 110.818.60 enables technical revisions to WCC Chapter 
110 (Development Code) by the Director of the Planning and Building Division.  Technical 
revisions are initiated by the Director and proceed directly to the Washoe County Board of 
County Commissioners (BCC) for a first and second reading.  WCC Section 110.818.60(e) 
requires that Planning Commissioners be notified of the proposed technical revision and be 
provided the opportunity to provide objections or comments. 

This memorandum describes a proposed technical revision involving the number of required 
van accessible handicapped parking spaces.  The technical revision will be heard by the BCC for 
an introduction and first reading of the Development Code ordinance on October 9, 2018.  The 
second reading and possible adoption of the ordinance is tentatively scheduled for October 23, 
2018.  

I request that you provide any objections or comments on the proposed technical revision to 
me no later than September 6, 2018.  Any objections or comments will be included in my staff 
report to the BCC for the introduction and first reading of the ordinance as required by WCC 
Section 110.818.60(e)(i).  You may e-mail objections/comments to me at 
bwebb@washoecounty,.us, phone me at (775) 328-3623), or use postal mail at the PO Box 
mailing address found in the upper right hand corner of this memorandum. 

I thank you in advance for your review and consideration of this technical revision. 

PROPOSED TECHNICAL REVISION 

Handicapped parking spaces are regulated within WCC Chapter 100 (Buildings and 
Construction) and the Development Code.  Both WCC Chapters establish the handicapped 
parking spaces required for new development (Development Code) and new buildings or uses 
within a building (Building and Construction).  Specific to this technical revision, WCC Section 
110.410.15(c)(1) requires that one of every eight required handicapped parking spaces be a van 
accessible space (code extract appears below, highlights added). 

Attachment F

mailto:bwebb@washoecounty,.us


Memo to: Washoe County Planning Commissioners 
Subject: Technical Revision to Development Code, Van Accessible Handicapped Parking Spaces 
Date: August 29, 2018 
Page: 2 

 

Section 110.410.15  Special Parking Provisions. 

 

(c) Handicapped Parking.  In any parking facility serving the public, parking for the handicapped 

shall be provided as set forth in this subsection. 

 

(1) Handicapped parking spaces shall be provided in accordance with Table 110.410.15.1.  

One (1) of every eight (8) required handicapped spaces shall be a van accessible space 

(a minimum of one (1) van accessible space per parking area). 

 
This section of the Development Code was last amended on July 7, 1993.  Planning staff was 
informed by a concerned citizen that the 2010 U.S. Department of Justice (DOJ) Americans with 
Disabilities Act (ADA) Standards (Titles II and III) require that for every six handicapped parking 
spaces, at least one shall be a van parking space (section 208.2.4, see attached extract from DOJ 
ADA Chapter 2, highlights added). 
 
The DOJ ADA Standards provide guidance to local jurisdictions, but do not carry the force of law 
when enforcing local jurisdiction development and building regulations.  However, staff 
researched the 2012 International Building Code (IBC) for handicapped parking requirements 
and discovered that Section 1106.5, Van Spaces, requires that for every six handicapped 
accessible parking spaces, at least one shall be a van-accessible parking space (see attached 
extract from the 2012 IBC, highlights added).   
 
The 2012 IBC was adopted by reference into WCC Chapter 100, so the IBC carries the force of 
law for building regulations within unincorporated Washoe County.  Therefore the 
Development Code must be amended to conform to WCC Chapter 100.  The specific technical 
revision to the Development Code appears below (highlights added): 
 

Section 110.410.15  Special Parking Provisions. 

 

(c) Handicapped Parking.  In any parking facility serving the public, parking for the handicapped 

shall be provided as set forth in this subsection. 

 

(1) Handicapped parking spaces shall be provided in accordance with Table 110.410.15.1.  

One (1) of every six eight (8) required handicapped spaces shall be a van accessible 

space (a minimum of one (1) van accessible space per parking area). 

 
The technical revisions will also make minor grammar edits within WCC Section 110.410.15 to 
eliminate duplicate numbering.  Specifically, a reference to “one (1)” will be amended to read 
as “one”.  Letters will be used for numbers from one to nine, and numbers for any number 
greater than 10. 
 
Enclosures:  as 
 



 

 

COMMUNITY SERVICES DEPARTMENT 
Planning and Building Division 

Planning Program 

1001 EAST 9
TH

 STREET 
PO BOX 11130 
RENO, NEVADA 89520-0027 
PHONE (775) 328-6100 
FAX (775) 328.6133  

 
 

August 29, 2018 
 
 SUSPENSE:  SEPTEMBER 6, 2018 
 
To: Washoe County Citizen Advisory Board Members 
 
From: Bob Webb, Planning Manager 
 
Subject: Technical Revision to Development Code, Van Accessible Handicapped Parking 

Spaces 
 
Washoe County Code (WCC) Section 110.818.60 enables technical revisions to WCC Chapter 
110 (Development Code) by the Director of the Planning and Building Division.  Technical 
revisions are initiated by the Director and proceed directly to the Washoe County Board of 
County Commissioners (BCC) for a first and second reading.  WCC Section 110.818.60(e) 
requires that Citizen Advisory Board Chairs and members be notified of the proposed technical 
revision and be provided the opportunity to provide objections or comments. 
 
This memorandum describes a proposed technical revision involving the number of required 
van accessible handicapped parking spaces.  The technical revision will be heard by the BCC for 
an introduction and first reading of the Development Code ordinance on October 9, 2018.  The 
second reading and possible adoption of the ordinance is tentatively scheduled for October 23, 
2018.  
 
I request that you provide any objections or comments on the proposed technical revision to 
me no later than September 6, 2018.  Any objections or comments will be included in my staff 
report to the BCC for the introduction and first reading of the ordinance as required by WCC 
Section 110.818.60(e)(ii).  You may e-mail objections/comments to me at 
bwebb@washoecounty,.us, phone me at (775) 328-3623), or use postal mail at the PO Box 
mailing address found in the upper right hand corner of this memorandum. 
 
I thank you in advance for your review and consideration of this technical revision. 
 
PROPOSED TECHNICAL REVISION 
 
Handicapped parking spaces are regulated within WCC Chapter 100 (Buildings and 
Construction) and the Development Code.  Both WCC Chapters establish the handicapped 
parking spaces required for new development (Development Code) and new buildings or uses 
within a building (Building and Construction).  Specific to this technical revision, WCC Section 
110.410.15(c)(1) requires that one of every eight required handicapped parking spaces be a van 
accessible space (code extract appears below, highlights added). 

mailto:bwebb@washoecounty,.us


Memo to: Washoe County Citizen Advisory Board Members 
Subject: Technical Revision to Development Code, Van Accessible Handicapped Parking Spaces 
Date: August 29, 2018 
Page: 2 

 

Section 110.410.15  Special Parking Provisions. 

 

(c) Handicapped Parking.  In any parking facility serving the public, parking for the handicapped 

shall be provided as set forth in this subsection. 

 

(1) Handicapped parking spaces shall be provided in accordance with Table 110.410.15.1.  

One (1) of every eight (8) required handicapped spaces shall be a van accessible space 

(a minimum of one (1) van accessible space per parking area). 

 
This section of the Development Code was last amended on July 7, 1993.  Planning staff was 
informed by a concerned citizen that the 2010 U.S. Department of Justice (DOJ) Americans with 
Disabilities Act (ADA) Standards (Titles II and III) require that for every six handicapped parking 
spaces, at least one shall be a van parking space (section 208.2.4, see attached extract from DOJ 
ADA Chapter 2, highlights added). 
 
The DOJ ADA Standards provide guidance to local jurisdictions, but do not carry the force of law 
when enforcing local jurisdiction development and building regulations.  However, staff 
researched the 2012 International Building Code (IBC) for handicapped parking requirements 
and discovered that Section 1106.5, Van Spaces, requires that for every six handicapped 
accessible parking spaces, at least one shall be a van-accessible parking space (see attached 
extract from the 2012 IBC, highlights added).   
 
The 2012 IBC was adopted by reference into WCC Chapter 100, so the IBC carries the force of 
law for building regulations within unincorporated Washoe County.  Therefore the 
Development Code must be amended to conform to WCC Chapter 100.  The specific technical 
revision to the Development Code appears below (highlights added): 
 

Section 110.410.15  Special Parking Provisions. 

 

(c) Handicapped Parking.  In any parking facility serving the public, parking for the handicapped 

shall be provided as set forth in this subsection. 

 

(1) Handicapped parking spaces shall be provided in accordance with Table 110.410.15.1.  

One (1) of every six eight (8) required handicapped spaces shall be a van accessible 

space (a minimum of one (1) van accessible space per parking area). 

 
The technical revisions will also make minor grammar edits within WCC Section 110.410.15 to 
eliminate duplicate numbering.  Specifically, a reference to “one (1)” will be amended to read 
as “one”.  Letters will be used for numbers from one to nine, and numbers for any number 
greater than 10. 
 
Enclosures:  as 
 


	BCC 10-23-18 - Staff report - van parking ordinance adoption - Bob
	BCC 10-23-18 - Attachment A - WDCA18-0004 - Proposed Ordinance
	BCC 10-23-18 - Attachment B - WDCA18-0004 - 2010 DOJ ADA Standards
	BCC 10-23-18 - Attachment C - WDCA18-0004 - 2012 IBC Section 1106
	BCC 10-23-18 - Attachment D - WDCA18-0004 - WCC Section 110.818.60
	BCC 10-23-18 - Attachment E - WDCA18-0004 - Initiation
	BCC 10-23-18 - Attachment F - WDCA18-0004 - Notice to PC and CAB

